IFB 18-36 Bid Pricing Sheet

IFB#20-46 Pricing Sheet

Note: Please enter the prices as requested in the spaces that are marked in BRIGHT YELLOW. The rest of the cells are locked. Totals Prices will be calculated automatically by the embeded formulas. Please write No Bid if you are not bidding an

Per Unit Price

Trade-in Price

Engine

Bidder Name:

Signature:
Company:

item.
Total Price ((Unit Price X No. of
. . QUANTITY TRADE IN . . Units) - Trade-in allowance +
Item Vehicle Description A) UNIT PRICE (B) ALLOWANCE (C) MINIMUM WARRANTY (includes both standard and extended warranties) (Total cost of Warranty X no. of
Vehicle))
EXTENDED WARRANTY (Standard Warranty is to be included at no cost)

Coverage Mileage Limi{Length of Coverage (Years)
Basic 36,000 3
Drlx{etraln: Gas 60,000 5
Engine

Per Unit Price Trade-in Price Corrosion Unlimited 5
EMISSIONS 50,000 5

*Please attach the most current standard and extended warranty options. The City reserves the right to select
2020 or Newer Ford F-350 . o .
warranty items beyond the extended warranty categories listed above once an award is made.
XLT DRW 4WD Regular
Cab 60CACAB and Chassis
only. Refer to Exhibit A
1 Trade-In 2006 Ford F-550 1 Extended Warranty $0.00
Utility Tr'"d( (ak'a: R-30) Coverage Mileage Length of Total Cost of Warranty
1 with V6IN' 0870 Limit Coverage per vehicle (D)
FDAF57P56EC7087! (Years)
Premium Care 75,000.00 8 $
Total Cost of Warranty
per vehicle (D)
$0.00 $0.00
$0
EXTENDED WARRANTY (Standard Warranty is to be included at no cost)

Coverage Mileage Limi{Length of Coverage (Years)
Basic 36,000 3
Drivetrain: Diesel 100,000 5




IFB 18-36 Bid Pricing Sheet

Note: Please enter the prices as requested in the spaces that are marked in BRIGHT YELLOW. The rest of the cells are locked. Totals Prices will be calculated automatically by the embeded formulas. Please write No Bid if you are not bidding an

item.
Total Price ((Unit Price X No. of
. . QUANTITY TRADE IN . . Units) - Trade-in allowance +
Item Vehicle Description A) UNIT PRICE (B) ALLOWANCE (C) MINIMUM WARRANTY (includes both standard and extended warranties) (Total cost of Warranty X no. of
Vehicle))
Corrosion Unlimited
2020 or Newer - Ford Super
Duty F-550 DRW 4WD EMISSIONS 50,000
STX Decor Refer to
2 Exhibit B. Trade-In: 2007 1 *Please attach the most current standard and extended warranty options. The City reserves the right to select |g0.00
Chevy 3500HD Flatbed warranty items beyond the extended warranty categories listed above once an award is made.
Graffiti Truck (aka: H-19)
with VIN:
1GBJK34U37E157620 Extended Warranty
Coverage Mileage Length of Total Cost of Warranty
Limit Coverage per vehicle (D)
(Years)
$0.00 $0.00 Premium Care 75,000.00 8 $
Total Cost of Warranty
per vehicle (D)
$0
EXTENDED WARRANTY (Standard Warranty is to be included at no cost)
Coverage Mileage Limi{Length of Coverage (Years)
Basic 36,000
Drlx{etraln: Gas 60,000
Engine
Per Unit Price Trade-in Price Corrosion Unlimited
2020 or Newer Ford F-350
DRW 4WD Regular Cab EMISSIONS 50000
141" WB 60CA Cab and
Chassis only. (Break-Out
3 Utility Truck) |
Refer to Exhibit C. *Please attach the most current standard and extended warranty options. The City reserves the right to select $0.00

Trade-In: 2007 Ford F-
450 Utility Truck (aka: H-
8) with VIN:

1FDXF46P37EA01595

warranty items beyond the extended warranty categories listed above once an award is made.

Extended Warranty

Bidder Name:
Signature:
Company:




IFB 18-36 Bid Pricing Sheet

Note: Please enter the prices as requested in the spaces that are marked in BRIGHT YELLOW. The rest of the cells are locked. Totals Prices will be calculated automatically by the embeded formulas. Please write No Bid if you are not bidding an

item.
Total Price ((Unit Price X No. of
. . QUANTITY TRADE IN . . Units) - Trade-in allowance +
Item Vehicle Description A) UNIT PRICE (B) ALLOWANCE (C) MINIMUM WARRANTY (includes both standard and extended warranties) (Total cost of Warranty X no. of
Vehicle))
Coverage Mileage Length of Total Cost of Warranty
Limit Coverage per vehicle (D)
(Years)
$0.00 $0.00 Premium Care 75,000.00 8 $
Total Cost of Warranty
per vehicle (D)
0
EXTENDED WARRANTY (Standard Warranty is to be included at no cost)
Coverage Mileage Limi{Length of Coverage (Years)
Basic 36,000 3
grlx{etraln: Gas 60,000 5
Per Unit Price Trade-in Price ngimne
Corrosion Unlimited 5
2020 or Newer - Ford F-150
SRW 4WD Super Cab 8ft EMISSIONS 50,000 5
Box STX (Sanitation Truck
W/ Power Liftgate) Refer ) . .
to Exhibit D. Trade-In: *Please attach the most current standard and extended warranty options. The City reserves the right to select
4 2012 Ford F-350 Pick-up 1 warranty items beyond the extended warranty categories listed above once an award is made. $0.00
Truck W/ Power Liftgate
(aka: S-1) with VIN: Extended Warranty
1FT8X3B65CEC31811
Coverage Mileage Length of Total Cost of Warranty
Limit Coverage per vehicle (D)
(Years)
$0.00 $0.00 Premium Care | 75,000.00 8 $

Total Cost of Warranty
per vehicle (D)

Bidder Name:

Signature:
Company:




IFB 18-36 Bid Pricing Sheet

Note: Please enter the prices as requested in the spaces that are marked in BRIGHT YELLOW. The rest of the cells are locked. Totals Prices will be calculated automatically by the embeded formulas. Please write No Bid if you are not bidding an

2) with VIN:
1FT8X3B69CEC31813
- (1) 2012 Ford F-350 4X4
(aka: H-6) with VIN:
1FT8X3B60CEC31814.

item.
Total Price ((Unit Price X No. of
. . QUANTITY TRADE IN . . Units) - Trade-in allowance +
Item Vehicle Description A) UNIT PRICE (B) ALLOWANCE (C) MINIMUM WARRANTY (includes both standard and extended warranties) (Total cost of Warranty X no. of
Vehicle))
EXTENDED WARRANTY (Standard Warranty is to be included at no cost)
Coverage Mileage Limi{Length of Coverage (Years)
Basic 36,000 3
grlx{etraln: Gas 60,000 5
Per Unit Price Trade-in Price ngmne
2020 or Newer - Ford Super Corrosion Unlimited >
Duty F-350 SRW 4WD
Super Cab 8ft Box 158” XL EMISSIONS 50,000 5
or STX (With Plows and
Sanders) Refe‘r to Exhibit *Please attach the most current standard and extended warranty options. The City reserves the right to select
E.Trade-In : (1) 2012 warranty items beyond the extended warranty categories listed above once an award is made.
5 Ford F-350 4X4 (aka: H- 2 $0.00

$0.00

Extended Warranty

Coverage Mileage Length of Total Cost of Warranty
$0.00 Limit Coverage per vehicle (D)

. (Years)
Premium Care 75,000.00 8 $
Total Cost of Warranty
per vehicle (D)

$0.00

Bidder Name:

Signature:
Company:




